DN W~

Reprint
as at 7 December 2014

War Pensions Amendment
Act (No 2) 2010

Public Act 2010 No 106
Date of assent 23 August 2010
Commencement see section 2

War Pensions Amendment Act (No 2) 2010: repealed, on 7 December 2014,
pursuant to section 276 of the Veterans’ Support Act 2014 (2014 No 56).

Contents
Page
Title 1
Commencement 2
Principal Act amended 2
Interpretation 2
Abatement 2

The Parliament of New Zealand enacts as follows:

1

Note

Title
This Act is the War Pensions Amendment Act (No 2) 2010.

Changes authorised by subpart 2 of Part 2 of the Legislation Act 2012 have been made
in this official reprint.

Note 4 at the end of this reprint provides a list of the amendments incorporated.

This Act is administered by the New Zealand Defence Force and Veterans’ Affairs
New Zealand.


http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM5538109
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2998524

Reprinted as at

s2 War Pensions Amendment Act (No 2) 2010 7 December 2014
2 Commencement
This Act comes into force on 27 September 2010.
3 Principal Act amended
This Act amends the War Pensions Act 1954.
4 Interpretation
The definition of Income Test 3 in section 67(1) is amended
by omitting “$80” and substituting “$100”.
5 Abatement
(1)  Section 74D(3)(a) and (4)(a) are amended by omitting “$80”
and substituting in each case “$100”.
(2) Section 74D is amended by omitting “$180” in each place

where it appears and substituting in each case “$200”.



http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM284374
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM285276
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM285563
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM285563

Reprinted as at
7 December 2014  War Pensions Amendment Act (No 2) 2010 Notes

Reprints notes

1

General

This is a reprint of the War Pensions Amendment Act (No 2)
2010 that incorporates all the amendments to that Act as at the
date of the last amendment to it.

Legal status

Reprints are presumed to correctly state, as at the date of the
reprint, the law enacted by the principal enactment and by any
amendments to that enactment. Section 18 of the Legislation
Act 2012 provides that this reprint, published in electronic
form, has the status of an official version under section 17 of
that Act. A printed version of the reprint produced directly
from this official electronic version also has official status.

Editorial and format changes

Editorial and format changes to reprints are
made using the powers under sections 24 to
26 of the Legislation Act 2012. See also
http://www.pco.parliament.govt.nz/editorial-conventions/.

Amendments incorporated in this reprint
Veterans® Support Act 2014 (2014 No 56): section 276

Wellington, New Zealand:
Published under the authority of the New Zealand Government—2014


http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2998516
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2998515
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2998532
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM2998532
http://www.pco.parliament.govt.nz/editorial-conventions/
http://www.legislation.govt.nz/pdflink.aspx?id=DLM5538109

